% City of Las Cruces

PEOPLE HELPING PEOPLE
Council Action and Executive Summary

item # 10 Ordinance/Resolution# 12-13-360
For Meeting of For Meeting of May 6, 2013
(Ordinance First Reading Date) (Adoption Date)

Please check box that applies to this item:
[ lQUASI JUDICIAL [ ILEGISLATIVE [XJADMINISTRATIVE

TITLE: ARESOLUTION TO AWARD AN INDEFINITE QUANTITY, INDEFINITE COST PRICE
AGREEMENT FOR OIL, LUBRICANTS, AND ANTIFREEZE TO CONSERVANCY OIL
CO., OF ALBUQUERQUE, NEW MEXICO FOR A TERM OF FIVE (5) YEARS
SUBJECT TO APPROVED BUDGET APPROPRIATIONS AND ANNUAL RENEWAL
FROM ORIGINAL BID NO. 12-13-360.

PURPOSE(S) OF ACTION:

Award a price agreement.

COUNCIL DISTRICT: N/A

Drafter/Staff Contact: Department/Section: | Phone:
Michael Vogel Transportation/Fleet 541-2596
Services A

City Manager Signature: w \
D I

BACKGROUND / KEY ISSUES / CONTRIBUTING FACTORS:

The purpose of this price agreement is to provide the most economical method of procurement
of oil, lubricants, and antifreeze for the City of Las Cruces Fleet Services customers. Utilization
of price agreements allows Fleet Services staff to procure needed supplies in the most effective
manner.

On September 28, 2012, the City of Las Cruces advertised an Invitation to Bid for Bid No. 12-13-
360 — Fleet Oil, Lubricant, and Antifreeze Price Agreement. The Invitation to Bid closed on
October 18, 2012 at 2:00 P.M. At the time of closing, four (4) bids were received. Upon the
tabulation of the bids, Conservancy Oil Co. was the low, responsible, responsive bidder.

The Fleet QOil, Lubricant, and Antifreeze Price Agreement will be for a term of one (1) - year with
four (4), one (1) - year options to renew. Renewal options are subject to Council approval.




Council Action and Executive Summang14 Page 2

SUPPORT INFORMATION:

Resolution.

1.
2; Exhibit “A”, Purchasing Manager's Request to Contract (PMRC).

3. Attachment “A”, Fleet Management Request to Award Memorandum.
4. Attachment “B”, Bid Tabulation.

SOURCE OF FUNDING:

Is this action already budgeted?
Yes (<] See fund summary below
No [ 1] If No, then check one below:
Budget [ 1| Expense reallocated from:
Adjustment
Attached || || Proposed funding is from a new revenue
source (i.e. grant; see details below)
||| Proposed funding is from fund balance in
the Fund.
Does this action create any
revenue? Yes X] | Funds will be deposited into this fund:
6150 in the amount of $90,000.00 for
FY12/13.
No || There is no new revenue generated by
this action.
BUDGET NARRATIVE

This price agreement is to be used “as needed”. Funding will be through the Fleet
Management Cost of Materials Sold to Departments Account No. 61323010-730920.
$143,631.87 is the current available funding as of 04/05/2013.

FUND EXPENDITURE SUMMARY:

Fund Name(s) | Account Expenditure | Available Remaining | Purpose
Number(s) | Proposed Budgeted Funds Funds for
in Current FY Remaining
Funds
6150: 61323010- | $90,000.00 $233,631.87 $143,631.87 | Future
Fleet Services 730920 vehicle part
Cost of Materials and service
Sold to purchases.
Departments
OPTIONS / ALTERNATIVES:
1. Vote “Yes”; this will approve the Resolution to award an indefinite quantity, indefinite cost

price agreement for oil, lubricants, and antifreeze to Conservancy Qil Co. of Albuquerque,

New Mexico.




Council Action and Executive Summang15 Page 3

2 Vote “No”; this will deny the Resolution and prohibit the indefinite quantity, indefinite cost
price agreement for oil, lubricants, and antifreeze. This would require Fleet Management
to re-bid the Oil, Lubricant, and Antifreeze Price Agreement, or pursue other options as
directed by City Council; which may result in a higher cost to the City of Las Cruces.

3. Vote to “Amend”; this could modify the Resolution and advise staff of necessary
adjustments as deemed appropriate.
4. Vote to “Table”; this could delay the purchase for oil, lubricants, and antifreeze; and may

have an effect on the efficiency of services.

REFERENCE INFORMATION:

N/A
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RESOLUTION NO. 12-13-360

A RESOLUTION TO AWARD AN INDEFINITE QUANTITY, INDEFINITE COST PRICE
AGREEMENT FOR OIL, LUBRICANTS, AND ANTIFREEZE TO CONSERVANCY OIL
CO., OF ALBUQUERQUE, NEW MEXICO FOR A TERM OF FIVE (5) YEARS
SUBJECT TO APPROVED BUDGET APPROPRIATIONS AND ANNUAL RENEWAL
FROM ORIGINAL BID NO. 12-13-360.
The City Council is informed that:

WHEREAS, the Fleet Management Section, on behalf of the City of Las Cruces,
requests to award the Fleet Oil, Lubricant, and Antifreeze Price Agreement; and

WHEREAS, Bid No. 12-13-360 remains effective and compliant with published
specifications; and

WHEREAS, four (4) bids were received for the Fleet Oil, Lubricant, and
Antifreeze Price Agreement; and

WHEREAS, the Fleet Management Section reviewed the bids; the low,
responsible, responsive bid was from Conservancy Oil Co., of Albuquerque, New
Mexico; and

WHEREAS, the Fleet Management Section recommends that the Fleet Oil,
Lubricant, and Antifreeze Price Agreement be awarded to Conservancy Oil Co. in an
indefinite quantity, indefinite cost price agreement for a term not to exceed five (5) years
subject to approved budget appropriations and annual renewal.

NOW, THEREFORE, Be it resolved by the governing body of the City of Las
Cruces:

(1)
THAT an indefinite quantity, indefinite cost price agreement of a term not to

exceed five (B) years, subject to approved budget appropriations and annual renewal for
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fleet oil, lubricant, and antifreeze be awarded to Conservancy QOil Co. of Albuquerque,
New Mexico.
(I
THAT the Purchasing Manager is authorized to contract with Conservancy Oil
Co., of Albuquerque, New Mexico as outlined in Exhibit “A", Purchasing Manager's
Request to Contract Form, attached hereto.
()
THAT funding will be through the Fleet Management Cost of Materials Sold to
Departments Account No. 61323010-730920.
(IV)
THAT City staff is hereby authorized to do all deeds necessary in the

accomplishment of the herein above.

DONE AND APPROVED this day of , 20
APPROVED:
Mayor
ATTEST:
City Clerk

(SEAL)



Moved by:

Seconded by:

APPROVED AS TO FORM:

Ciiy iﬁtomey % m’uﬂﬁ
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VOTE:

Mayor Miyagishima:

Councillor Silva:
Councillor Smith:

Councillor Pedroza:

Councillor Small:
Councillor Sorg:
Councillor Thomas:

s



Exhibit A
CITY OF LAS CRUCES

PURCHASING MANAGER’S REQUEST TO CONTRACT

For Meeting of: May 6, 2013

Resolution No.: 12-13-360

Contract Purchase For
Oil, Lubricants, and Antifreeze Price Agreement

The Las Cruces City Council is provided the following information concerning this request:

BID SOLICITATION INFORMATION:

1. Bid Due Date: October 18, 2012
2. Description: Oil, Lubricants, and Antifreeze Price Agreement
3. Using Department: Transportation / Fleet
4. Number of Responses Solicited: Sixteen (16)
5.  Number of Responses Received and Accepted: Four (4)
6. Recommended Award(s) To: Conservancy Oil Company, of Albuquerque, NM
7. Total Award Amount (includes any tax and contingency): Indefinite Quantity/Cost
8. Contract Duration: Five (5) years subject to approved budget

appropriations and annual renewals

LOCAL PREFERENCE FACTOR

Local Preference No LCMC §24-100 not applicable to this solicitation
Factor Applied Per Yes | X Made A Difference To Bid Awards(s)
LCMC §24-100 X | Made No Difference To Bid Award(s)

PROCUREMENT CODE COMPLIANCE:
The City of Las Cruces Procurement Code was administered in the conduct of this procurement

and approval to purchase is hereby requested wﬁion 24-91.
s D L2003

Purchasing Manager Date

CONFIRMATION OF FUND ENCUMBRANCE:
[REQUISITION or PURCHASE ORDER NUMBER: | Reg. 13101191
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320
ity of Las Gruces
PEOPLE HELPING PEOPLE
TO: Karen Medina, Senior Buyer
\\’XV
FROM: Michael Vogel, Fleet Management Administrator “(\Q]
DATE: December 18, 2012

SUBJECT: Acceptance Memorandum for Fleet Oil, Lubricants, and Antifreeze Price
Agreement Bid No. 12-13-360

The Fleet Management Section has reviewed the bid submitted for the Fleet Oil, Lubricants, and
Antifreeze Price Agreement, Bid No. 12-13-360, and is recommending award to Conservancy
Oil of Las Cruces, New Mexico; for oil, lubricants, and antifreeze in an indefinite quantity,
indefinite cost.

The bid submitted was compliant with the published specifications of Bid No. 12-13-360, and
the Fleet Management Section considers the bids to represent a fair and equitable agreement for
the City of Las Cruces.

Requisition No. 13101191 has been generated utilizing the Cost of Materials Sold to
Departments Account No. 61323010-730920.

Should you have any questions regarding this matter, please feel free to contact me at 541-2596.

cc: Lisa Murphy, Transportation Director
Project File



ATTACHMENT "B"

PEOPLE

‘Y OF LAS CRUCES PURCHASING DEPARTMENT

STRACT OF BID: Fieet Oll, Lubricants & Aatifreeze Price Agreement 12-13-360

OPENING DATE: October 18, 2012 @ 2 p.m. MST

City of Las Cruces

HELPING

PEOPLE

ElPaso, TX 79907
H_m 915,859.9271

C&R Uun:w:e.ﬁ ELC-

OF b,.w Pﬂwmun.wz.__.m

4 15/40wt* Motor Om in guart naEu._.:ﬂa Texaco Super URSA Flus, Delo _n.oc or 3:& 147 | Cese/12 Chevren or Equivalent $42.96 $6,315.12 No Bid No Bid
15/40wt* Motor Oil in galion Texaco Super URSA Plus, Delo 400 or equal 380 | Gallon Chevron or Equivalent $5.02 $7,937.60 Total or Equivalent $8.76 $7,708.80
-~ |15/40wr* Motor Ol in 55 gallon drums. Texaco Super URSA Plus, Delo 400 or egual 16 | Drum Cheyron or Equivalent $496.10 $7,937.60 Total or Equivalent $482.05 $7.712.80
15/40wt* Motor Oil bulk. Texaca Super URSA Plus, Delo 400 or equal (330 Gallon Tank) 1 Tank Chevron or Equi *0.00 $0.00 Total or Equivalent* 30.00 $0.00
30wt**Maotor Oil in quarts Delo 400, Texaco USRA Super Plus or equsl 5 | Case/12| Chevron or Equivalent $33.08 $165.40 No Bid No Bid No Bid
30wt**Motor Oil in gallons Delo 400, Texaco USRA Super Plus or equal 30 | Gallon | Chevron or Equivalent $10.89 $326.70 No Bid No Bid No Bid
30wi**Motor Oil in 55 gallon drums. Pelo 400, Texaco URSA Super Plus or equsl 2 | Dum | _Chevron or Equivalent $602.56 $1.205.12 Total or Equivalent §533.17 $1,066.34
40wt**Maotor Ol in 55 gallon drums. Rotella T-40 or equal 19 | Drum Chevron or Equivalent $594.17 $11,289.23 Total or Equivalent $536.41 $10,191.79
40wt**Motor Oil in 55 gallon drums. Rotella T-40 or equal 2 | Drum Chevron or Equivalent $594.17 $1,188.34 Totsl or Equivalent $536.41 $1,072.82
5-20wt***Motor Oi! or equal in quarts Meeting API service SL; SJ: JLSAC GE-3 110 | Case/12| Chevron or Equivalent $38.41 $4,225,10 No Bid No Bid _ No Bid
5-20wt***Motor Oil or equal in gallons Mecting API service SL; SJ; JLSAC GE-3 660 | Gallon Chevron or Equivalent $7.58 $5,002.80 Tote! or Equivalent $7.50 $4,950.00
I Tractor Hydraulic Oil or equal in 5 gallon Bucket. Texaco TDH or equal 66 | Bucket |  Chevron or Equivalent $42.27 $2.789.82 Total or Equivalent $42.06 $2,775.96
- |Universal Tractor Hydraulic Oil or equal in 55 gallon drums. Texaco TDH or equal 6 Drum Chevron or Equivalent $465.05 $2,790.30 Total or Equivalent $462.71 $2,776.26
* |Universal Tractor Hydraulic Oil in bulk Texaco TDH or equal (330 Gallon Tank) 330 | Gallon Chevron or Equivalenmt $8.45 $2,788.50 Total or Equivalent $8.41 $2,775.30
“ |Dexron 1 Automatic Trensmission Fluid or equal in quarts 23 | Case/12| Chevren or Equivalent §33.51 $770.73 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Dexyon III Automatic Tra Fluid or equal in gallons 550 | Gallon Chevron or Equivalent $8.23 $4,526.50 Taotal or Equivalent $8.21 $4,515.50
-|Dexron HI Automatic Ti Fluid or equal in 55 gallon drum 10 | Dmum Chevron or Equivalent $453.02 $4.530.20 Total or Equivalent $452.02 $4,520.20
{Desxron I A ic Tt Fluid or equal (330 Gallon Tank) 1 Tank Chevren or Equivalent *0.00 No Bid Total or Equivalent* $0.00 $0.00
Automotive T Qil Mercon-V or equal, in quarts 92 | Case/12 Chevren or Equivelent NoBid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Automotive Transmissian Oil Mercon-V in gallons 550 | Gallon Chevron or Equivelent $15.07 $8,288.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid
| Automotive Transmission Qil Mercon-V in 55 gallon drum 10 | Drum Chevron or Equivalent $829.37 $8,293.70 No Bid No Bid No Bid
175-140 Gear Oil in quarts 92 |Cese/12] Chevron or Equivelent $12.38 $1,138.96 No Bid No Bid No Bid
||75-140 Gear Oil in 5 gallon buckets 100 | Bucket Chevron or Equivalent $138.28 $13.828.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
“1175-140 Gear Oil in 120 [b keg 10 Keg Chevron or Equivalent $464.80 $4.648.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
i180-90 Gear Qil in quarts 92 | Case/12| Chevron or Equivalent $4.20 $386.40 No Bid No Bid No Bid
|80-90 Gear Qil with an OK to fill rating, S gallon buckets. 100 | Bucket Chevron or Equivalent $61.45 $6,145.00 Mo Bid No Bid No Bid
"180-90 Geer Oil with an OK to fill rating, 120 pound keg, 10 Keg Chevren c_.mmu?u_n.._ $240.18 $2,401.80 No Bid No Bid No Bid

Page 1
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PEOPLE HELPING PEOPLE

CITY OF LAS CRUCES PURCHASING DEPARTMENT
ABSTRACT OF BID: Fleet Oil, Lubricants & Antifreeze Price Agreement 12-13-360
OPENING DATE: October 18,2012 @ 2 p.m. MST

City of Las Gruces’

S Obwdwﬂ&:ﬁn LYC:
3 . Prado. -
iEl Paso, TX dﬁ_q
PH: wmm.mwuvond.

“ANTE: mmhmm@noahwzﬂ i

" |Ethylene Glycol mu:.mdﬁo Hoi mEomﬁ PAR anti-freeze/coolant monuﬁuﬂoa 8 meet Rn_.:agn:m of
" laluminum engine companent protection and heavy duty diesel engines, This enti-freeze/coolant must
carry al] normal additives such as; anti-foam, anti-rust, et. Anti-freeze/coolant shall be delivered to
the City in sufficient strength to allow maximurn protection to be obtained at 50% dilution with
water or equal. Pricing for a 55 gallon drum

Drum

Chevron or Equivalent

$204.72

$1,637.76

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

- |Ethylene Glycol anti-freeze low silicate PAR anti-freeze/coolant formulated to meet requirements of
“* {aluminum engine component protection and heavy duty diesel engines. This anti-freeze/coolent must
carry all normal edditives such as; anti-foam, anti-rust, et. Anti-freeze/coolant shall be delivered to
{the City in sufficient srength to allow maximum protection to be obtained at 50% dilution with
water or equal. 216-1 gallon container per pallet

L%

Pallet

Chevron or Equivalent

$1,958.40

$3,916.80

No Bid

Dex Cool or equal. Must be approved for GM vehicles. Pricing for 55 gallon drums

'S

Chevron or maE<u~aE

No Bid

\ Unx 08_ or B_E Zcm:ua TOVI

2 DELIVERY:
. ©. "/ |PRICES EFFECTIVE THROUGH:
" |PAYMENT TERMS:

... |PREFERENCE NUMBER:

NoBids: Brewer Oll Co.

Prepared by: gau._._.\euna.mﬁ Clerk

e S0

e__ﬁ.nmwm,_u_._. Karen Medina, Senior Buyer

._ﬁaagn Hmmaﬁwﬁwﬁgno%zmn
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- Gity of Las Gruces

PEOPLE HELPINGEG PEOPLE -~ - Conservancy. Oil
: /=_-3050 Harrison
CITY OF LAS CRUCES PURCHASING DEPARTMENT ; H.mm...ﬂ ruces, NM 88005
ABSTRACT OF BID: Fieet Oll, Lubricants & Antifreeze Price Agreeruent 12-13-360 . PH: §75.523.2325 :
OPENING DATE: October 18, 2012 @ 2 p.m. MST j e
nservancyoileom . ) i =
: |"PRICEEXT |~ "MFRBRA CE. |'PRICEEXT
1. i|15/40wt* Motor Oil in quart containers, Texaco Super URSA Plus, Delo 400 or equal Service Pro $25.64 528.49 $4,188.03 Motor Craft 544.85 $6,592.935
‘1] 15/40wt* Motor Oil in gallon containers, Texaco Super URSA Pius, Delo 400 or equal 880 | Gallon Service Pro $9.64 $10.71 $9,424.80 AC Delco 51638 $14.414.40
1| 15/40wt* Motor Oil in 55 gallon drums. Texaco Super URSA Plus, Delo 400 or equal 16 | Drum Service Pro $433.80 $482.00 $7,712.00 Motor Craft $674.31 $10,788.96
15/40wt* Motor Oil butk. Texaco Super URSA Plus, Delo 400 or equal (330 Gallon Tank) 1 Tank Service Pro $7.56 $8.40 $8.40 No Bid No Bid Mo Bid
30wi**Motor Oil in quarts Delo 400, Texaco USRA Super Plus or equal 5 | Case/12 Service Pro $38.60 942 89 $214.45 FVP $32.40 $162.00
|30wt**Motor il in gallons Delo 400, Texaco USRA Super Plus or nmm.l_ 30 | Gallon Service Pro $12.31 $13.68 $410.40 No Bid No Bid No Bid
30wt* *Motor Cil in 55 gallon drums. Delo 400, Texaco URSA Super Plus or equal 2 | Drum Service Pro $384.30]  $427.00 $854.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
40wi**Motor Oil in 55 gallon drums. Rotella T-40 or equal 19 | Drum Service Pro $421.74]  $468.60 $£8,903.40 No Bid No Bid No Bid
140wt**Motor Oil in 55 gallon drums. Rotella T-40 or equal 2 Drum Service Pro $42174]  $463.60 $037.20 No Bid No Bid No Bid
{5-20wt***Motor Oil or egual in quarts Meeting API service SL; SJ; JLSAC GE-3 110 | Case/i2 Service Pro $25.91 $28.79 $3,166.90 FVP $30.15 $3,316.50
5-20wt***Motor Qil or equal in gallons Meeting AP service SL: 8J; JLSAC GE-3 660 | Gallon Service Pro $6.48 $7.20 $4,752.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Universal Tractor Hydraulic Oil or equal in § gallon Bucket. Texaco TDH or equal 66 | Bucket Service Pro 338.86 $43.18 §2,849.88 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Universal Tractor Hydraulic Oil or equal in 55 gallon drums. Texaco TDH or equal 6 Drum Service Pro $379.24|  $4Z1.38 §2,528.28 No Bid No Bid No Bid
| Universal Tractor Hydraulic Oil in bulk Texaco TDH or equel (330 Gallon Tank) 330 | Gallon Service Pro $6.67 $7.41 $2,445.30 No Bid No Bid No Bid
/| Dexron [T Automatic Transmission Fluid or equal in quarts 23 | Case/12 Service Pro $26.06 $28.95 $665.85 FVP $30.45 $700.35
-{Dexron Il Automatic Transmission Fluid or equal in gallons 550 | Gallon Service Pro $6.41 $7.12 $3,916.00 Motor Craft $18.71 $10,290.50
exron I Automatic Transmission Fluid or equal in 55 gallon drum 10 | Dum Service Pro $364.50 $405.00 $4,050.00 Motor Craft §923.46 $9,234.60
| Dexron 11 Automatic Transmission Fluid or equal (330 Gallon Tank) 1 Tank Service Pro $6.30 $7.00 $7.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Automotive Transmission Oil Mercon-V or equal, in querts 92 | Case/12 Service Pro S17.28]  $19.20 $1.766.40 FVP £30.45 $2,801.40
“| Automotive Transmission Oil Mercon-V in gallons 550 | Galion Service Pro $8.92 $9.91 $5.450.50 Motor Crafi $18.71 $10,250.50
] Automotive Transmission Oil M V in 55 gallon drum 10 | Drum Service Pro $501.44 $557.15 $5.571.50 Mozor Creft $923.46 $9,234.60
75-140 Gear Oil in quarts 92 | Case/12 Service Pro S$140.35]  $155.95 $14,347.40 Motor Craft $186.15 $17,125.80
“|75-140 Gear Oil in 5 gallon bucksts 100 | Bucket Service Pro $134.78]  5149.76]  $514,976.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
175-140 Gear Oil in 120 1b keg 10 | Keg Service Pro §441.45  $490.50 $£4,905.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
' +.-180-90 Gear Ol in quarts 92 | Case/12 Service Pro £32.59] $36.21 £3,331.32 No Bid No Bid No Bid
~ |80-80 Gear Qil with an OK to fill rating, 5 gallon buckets. 100 | Bucket Service Pro $47.15 $£52.39 $5.239.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
80-90 Gear Oil with an OK to fill rating, 120 pound keg. 10 Keg Service Pro £165.01 $183.34 $1.833.40 No Bid No Bid No Bid
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PEOPLE HELPINGE PEOPLE

CITY OF LAS CRUCES PURCHASING DEPARTMENT
ABSTRACT OF BID: Fleet Oil, Lubricants & Antifreeze Price Agreement 12-13-360
OPENING DATE: October 18, 2012 @ 2 p.m. MST

£ City of Las Cruces’

Eactory Motor Parts
ES.&B»%:Q Blvd. Zﬁ
© Albuguergue; NM 87102
‘PH: 303.371.7455 .
: T19.434.2417 -

m_._ﬁ_—ga O_<8_ anti-freeze _oi silicate PAR anti-fresze/coolant mo:..EEnm to meet Bncna_ﬂm:ﬁ om

(it laluminam engine component protection and heavy duty diesel engines, This anti-freeze/s must
228, ~ |carry all normal additives such as; anti-foam, anti-rust, et. Anti-freeze/coolant shall be delivered to

the City in sufficient strength to allow maximum protection to be obtained at 50% dilution with

water or equal. Pricing for a 55 gallon drum Drum Service Pro $400.50]  $445.00 $3.560.00 Shell $402.28 $3,218.24
.| Ethylese Glycol anti-fresze low silicate PAR anti-freeze/coolant formulated to meet requirements of
*|aluminum engine component protection and heavy duty diesel engines. This anti-freeze/coolant must
29. carry all normal additives such as; anti-foam, anti-rust, et. Anti-freeze/coolant shall be delivered to
"~ Mhe City in sufficient strength to allow maximurn protection to be obtained at 50% dilution with
" iwater or equal. 216-1 gelion container per pallel Pallet Service Pro $1,594.08| $1,771.20 $3,542.40 Shell $3.196.80 $6.,393.60
30 " |Dex Cool or equal. Must be approved for GM vehicles. Pricing for 55 gallon drums Drum Service Pro $535.59|  £595.10 $2.380.40 Shell $487.03 $1,948.12
™ Sl .Unx ﬂS_ Q.Bza‘ EE_" wa wﬂﬁacon for mz .Ep—owm -on ms: iners per pallet Pallet Service Pro $2,126.74] 52,363.04 $4.726.08 Shell $3.990.60 $7,981.20
o i U§<
AL PRICES EFFECTIVE THROUGH:
PAYMENT TERMS:
. |PREFERENCE NUMBER:
NoBids: Brewer Oil Co.

wav-m w" Benny ro_._nm Bid CI :

Verified by: Karen Medira, Senior Buyer

Page 4

$115,796.96
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