3¢ City of Las Cruces

PEOPLE HELPING PEOPLE
Council Action and Executive Summary

item# 3 Ordinance/Resolution# 10-11-503
For Meeting of For Meeting of __May 2, 2011
(Ordinance First Reading Date) (Adoption Date)

TITLE: A RESOLUTION AWARDING AN INDEFINITE QUANTITY, INDEFINITE COST PRICE
AGREEMENT FOR ROAD CONSTRUCTION MATERIALS TO CEMEX, INC.; DE
READY MIX, INC.; CERTIFIED CONCRETE PRODUCTS, INC.; ALL OF LAS
CRUCES, NM, FOR ONE (1) YEAR WITH THE OPTION TO RENEW FOR THREE (3)
ADDITIONAL ONE (1) YEAR PERIODS SUBJECT TO APPROVED BUDGET
APPROPRIATIONS AND ANNUAL RENEWAL.

PURPOSE(S) OF ACTION:

Award Road Construction Materials Pricing Agreement

COUNCIL DISTRICT: 1-6

Drafter/Staff Co t: Department/Section: /| Phone:

Roy Arnoldt P. PW/ Engineering 528-3168
Services \

City Manager Signature: @Wﬂ 7
Robert Garza P.E, G

BACKGROUND / KEY ISSUES / CONTRIBUTING FACTORS:

The City of Las Cruces (City) contracts for the supply of road construction materials for various
projects on an as-needed basis throughout the year. The Engineering Services Section, on
behalf of the Street Systems Section of the Public Works Department, requested bids for road
construction materials in March 2011. The bid includes concrete, rock, hot mix asphalt, cold mix
asphalt, gravel, and sand. Items in this pricing agreement are used for construction,
maintenance, and repair of City roads and flood control structures on an as-needed basis.

Presently, Public Works lacks the ability to produce any of the aggregate, asphalt, or concrete
materials required for projects as the City does not have the specialty equipment, quarry sites,
manpower, or the required storage.

This pricing agreement is for a one (1) year contract with option to renew. The contract may be
renewed for three (3) additional one (1) year periods upon mutual, written agreement to be
initiated by the City. This contract will be awarded to multiple suppliers as the City has need to
obtain timely delivery of specific road construction materials and the concern is that a single-
source award would not be sufficient to meet the City’s demand. In the event of a multi-source
award, subsequent orders will be based upon low cost and timely delivery determinants that are
in the best interest of the City.
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The Public Works Department-Engineering Services Section has reviewed the bid for compliance
with the specifications and recommends award to Cemex, Inc.; Certified Concrete Products, Inc.;
DE Ready Mix, Inc.; all of Las Cruces, NM, at unit prices for road construction materials as listed
in the attached Exhibit “B” per attached specifications.

SUPPORT INFORMATION:

1. Resolution.

2. Exhibit “A”, Purchasing Manager's Request for Contract Form.
3. Attachment “A”, Vendor Bid Tabulation.

SOURCE OF FUNDING:
Is this action already budgeted?
Yes |[X| See fund summary below
No |[]] If No, then check one below:
Budget ]| Expense reallocated from:
Adjustment
Attached | [ ]| Proposed funding is from a new revenue
source (i.e. grant; see details below)
1| Proposed funding is from fund balance in
the Fund.
Does this action create any
revenue? Yes | [ ]| Funds will be deposited into this fund:
in the amount of $ for FY |
No [X]| There is no new revenue generated by
this action.

BUDGET NARRATIVE

Although this contract is used primarily by Public Works for street maintenance and the repair
of sidewalks and drainage facilities, the agreement can be used City wide. Utilities, Parks, and
Facilities have all utilized this contract using a variety of accounts as projects are identified and
materials are required. All expenditures are part of budgets approved for each individual
section and are typically part of on-going maintenance and repair activities and are not listed
as separate projects.

FUND EXPENDITURE SUMMARY:

Fund Name(s) Account Expenditure| Available | Remaining | Purpose for
Number(s) | Proposed | Budgeted | Funds Remaining Funds
Funds in
Current FY
Various Various Various Various Various Various
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OPTIONS / ALTERNATIVES:

1. Vote “Yes”: this action will award the bid to Cemex, Inc.; DE Ready Mix, Inc.; Certified
Concrete Products, Inc.; all of Las Cruces, NM, at unit prices for road construction
materials as listed in the attached vendor bid tabulation, Exhibit “B”, for a one (1) year
period, in an amount not to exceed City Council approved budgets. This will give potential
users the flexibility to purchase road construction materials on an as-needed basis using
unit prices that are set for the specified one (1) year period.

2. Vote “No”; this action will reject the proposed bid award and instruct staff to either rebid,
rescope or abandon the pricing agreement all together. Without this pricing agreement,
potential users will have to explore alternative means of procuring these materials.

3. Vote to “Amend”; this action would require time to modify the resolution with possible
interruption to the supply of construction materials and the delay of various projects.

4. Vote to “Table”; this action would interrupt the supply of construction materials to the City
and may cause work stoppages for maintenance and repair of facilities.

REFERENCE INFORMATION:

The resolution(s) and/or ordinance(s) listed below are only for reference and are not included as
attachments or exhibits.

N/A

Rev. 03/2011




29

RESOLUTION NO 10-11-503
A RESOLUTION AWARDING AN INDEFINITE QUANTITY, INDEFINITE COST PRICE
AGREEMENT FOR ROAD CONSTRUCTION MATERIALS TO CEMEX, INC.; DE
READY MIX, INC.; CERTIFIED CONCRETE PRODUCTS, INC.; ALL OF LAS
CRUCES, NM, FOR ONE (1) YEAR WITH THE OPTION TO RENEW FOR THREE (3)
ADDITIONAL ONE (1) YEAR PERIODS SUBJECT TO APPROVED BUDGET
APPROPRIATIONS AND ANNUAL RENEWAL.

The City Council is informed that:

WHEREAS, the City of Las Cruces (City) has the need to purchase road
construction materials to support the operation of City departments conducting on-going
maintenance activities; and

WHEREAS, presently, Public Works lacks the ability to produce any of the
aggregate, asphalt, or concrete materials required for projects, as the City does not
have the specialty equipment, quarry sites, manpower, or the required storage; and

WHEREAS, City staff recommends that the bid for Road Construction
Materials Pricing Agreement be awarded to Cemex, Inc.; Certified Concrete, Inc.; DE
Ready Mix, Inc.; all of Las Cruces, NM, at the unit prices (not including NMGRT) listed
in the vendor bid tabulation attached as Exhibit “B”, and in an amount not to exceed City
Council approved budgets.

NOW, THEREFORE, Be it resolved by the governing body of the City of
Las Cruces:

)

THAT the bid for Road Construction Materials Pricing Agreement is hereby

awarded to Cemex, Inc.; Certified Concrete Products, Inc.; DE Ready Mix, Inc.; all of Las
Cruces, NM, for a period of one (1) year at the unit prices (not including NMGRT) as listed

in the vendor bid tabulation, attached as Exhibit “B”, and in an amount not to exceed City
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Council approved budgets.
(1
THAT City staff is hereby authorized to do all deeds necessary in the

accomplishment of the herein above.

DONE AND APPROVED this day of , 2011
APPROVED:
(SEAL)
ATTEST: Mayor
City Clerk VOTE:
Mayor Miyagishima:

Councillor Silva:
Councillor Connor:

Moved by: Councillor Pedroza:
Councillor Small:
Seconded by: Councillor Sorg:

T

Councillor Thomas:
Approved as to Form:

AL D lontts

City/Attorney 4




Exhibit A

CITY OF LAS CRUCES

PURCHASING MANAGER’S REQUEST TO CONTRACT

For Meeting of: May 2, 2011

Resolution No.: 10-11-503

Contract Purchase For
Road Construction Materials Price Agreement

The Las Cruces City Council is provided the following information concerning this request:

BID SOLICITATION INFORMATION:

1. Bid Due Date: March 31, 2011
2. Description: Road Construction Materials
3. Using Department: Public Works
4.  Number of Responses Accepted: Four (4)
5.  Recommended Award(s) To: Cemex, Inc; DE Ready Mix, Inc.;

And Certified Concrete Products, Inc., All of Las Cruces, NM

6. Total Award Amount (not including NMGRT): Not to Exceed City Council Approved
Budgets

7. Contract Duration: One (1) Year With Option To Renew For Three (3)
Additional One (1) Year Periods

LOCAL PREFERENCE FACTOR
Local Preference No LCMC §24-100 not applicable to this solicitation
Factor Applied Per Yes | X X | Made A Difference To Bid Awards(s)
LCMC §24-100 Made No Difference To Bid Award(s)

PROCUREMENT CODE COMPLIANCE:
The City of Las Cruces Procurement Code was administered in the conduct of this procurement
and approval to purchase is hereby requested.pursuant to Section 24-91.

:\ﬁk“ % 14 ||2)z2o

urchasing Manager Date

CONFIRMATION OF FUND ENCUMBRANCE:
[ REQUISITION or PURCHASE ORDER NUMBER: | Various




ATTACHMENT *A"

City of Las

PEOPLE HEL

CITY OF LAS CRUCES PURCHASING DEPARTMENT

ABSTRACT OF BID: Road Construction Materials Price Agreement 10- 11-503

OPENING DATE: March 31,2011 @ 10:00 a.m.

s Gruces

ITEM B i RN JUNIT
1 "[Ready Mix Concrete 3000 PSI Conforming with Section 500 of specifications (Less than 3 Yd®)
) Delivered to site ] Yd® 1000 ~$95.00] $100.00 $100,000.00 $93,000.00
Ready Mix Concrete 3000 PSI Conforming with Section 500 of specifications (3 Yd® & greater)
] Delivered to site 1000 $80.75] $85.00 $85,000.00 $80.75] $85.00 $85,000.00
" [Polypropylene/fiber-glass fiber added to Yd3 concrete mix Conforming with Section 500 of specifications .
i Delivered to site mixed in concrete [~ Pound (added to Y& concrete) | 250 $4.66) $4.90 $1,225.00 $4.75 $5.00 $1,250.00
_|Flowable anosmo..aim with Section 515 of specifications
2 Sack Mix - delivered to site I Y& 1000 $69.35 $73.00 $73,000.00 $67.45) $71.00 $71,000.00
. 3 Sack Mix - delivered to site | Y4? 1000 $73.15] $77.00 $77,000.00 $73.15 $77.00 $77,000.00
" |Crusher Fines Conforming with Section 235 of specifications
City to pick up | Ton 1000 $2.14 $2.25 $2,250.00 $1.85 $1.95 $1,950.00
Delivered to site | Ton 1000 $6.18] $6.501 $6,500.00 $6.65 $7.00 $7,000.00
Base Course Conforming with Section 210 of specifications
City to pick up Ton 1000 $4.51 $4.75 $4,750.00 $4.04] $4.25 $4,250.00
Delivered to site Ton 4000 $9.98 $10.50 $42,000.00 $8.55 $9.00 $36,000.00
-“|Rip Rap Rock Type H Conforming with Section 225 of specifications |
% City to pick up Ton 500 $26.60, $28.00 $14,000.00 $19.95) $21.00 $10,500.00
Delivered to site Ton 500 $32.30) $34.00 $17,000.00 $21.5)) $29.00 $14,500.00
“IRip Rap Type L Conforming with Section 225 of specifications
City to pick up Ton 1000 $26.60 $28.00 $28,000.00 $19.95 $21.00 $21,000.00
Delivered to site Ton 1000 $32.30) $34.00 $34,000.00 $27.55] $29.00 $29,000.00
" [Rip Rap Rock Type VL Conforming with Section 225 of specifications _
| City to pick up Ton 1000 $26.60) $28.00 $28,000.00 $22.80) $24.00 $24,000.00
Delivered to site Ton 1000 mmu.uﬂ $34.00 $34,000.00 $31.35] $33.00 $33,000.00
|Rip Rap Rock Type M Conforming with Section 225 of specifications
City to pick up Ton 1000 $26.60) $28.00 $28,000.00 No Bid| No Bid No Bid
Delivered to site Ton 1000 $32.30] $34.00 $34,000.00 No Bid| No Bid No Bid
Hot Mix Asphalt Type A Conforming with Section 325 of specifications )
City to pick up Ton 500 $58.43) $61.50 $30,750.00 No Bid] No Bid No Bid
11B Delivered to site Ton 250 $65.08 $68.50 $17,125.00 No Bid| No Bid No Bid
12 Hot Mix Asphalt Type B Conforming with Section 325 of specifications
12A City to pick up Ton 2500 $58.43 $61.50 $153,750.00 No Bid| No Bid No Bid
0-5000 . . .
12B Delivered to site Ton $65.08 $68.50 $342,500.00* No Bid No Bid No Bid
5001-10000 $65.08 $68.50 $685,000.00* No Bid| No Bid No Bid!

Page 1

ABSTRACT



Cityo _. n Fuc nm,@

PEOPLE HEL NG PE

_CITY OF LAS CRUCES PURCHASING DEPARTMENT

ABSTRACT OF BID: Road Construction Materials Price Agreement 10-11-503

OPENING DATE: March 31, 2011 @ 10:00 a.m.

I'TEM M RIPTION.:
13 Hot Z_x >%§.= dﬁm C Conforming with woo:o: unu om muasmnm tions
13A City to pick up Ton 2500 $61.75) $65.00 $162,500.00 No Bid| No Bid No Bid
) 0-5000 $68.40) $72.00 $360,000.00* No Bid| No Bid No Bid
13B Delivered to site Ton
o 5001-10000 $68.40f $72.00 $720,000.00* No Bid| No Bid! No Bid
14" '|Cold Mix Asphalt Conforming with Section 320 of specifications
14A - City to pick up Ton 1000 $87.40) $92.00 $92,000.00 No Bid| No Bid| No Bid
15 |3/4" Gravel Conforming with Section 230 of specifications
15A City to pick up Ton 200 $9.50} $10.00 $2,000.00 $8.79) $9.25 $1,850.00
16 - {1” Gravel Conforming with Section 230 of specifications (over 6 tons)
FGA City pick up ] Ton | 200 $9.50] $10.00 $2,000.00 $8.79) $9.25 $1,850.00
A7 " |Plaster Sand Conforming with Section 240 of specifications (over 6 tons)
17A. City pick up | Ton | 500 $11.40} $12.00 $6,000.00 i $8.79 $9.25 $4,625.00
18 |4” to 6” River Rock (Clean, Native Rock) Must meet the approval of engineer or histher designee prior to delivery
184" " Delivered to site ] Ton | 500 $36.10 $38.00 $19,000.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
o Superpave, SP HI, Oil PG76-16 Conforming with NMSHTD Section 423. These specifications can be reviewed on the
NMDOT website under “Standard specifications for Highways and Bridge construction”.
19 0-5000 $87.40) $92.00 $460,000.00* No Bid No Bid No Bid
Delivered to site Ton 5001-12500 $87.40 $92.00 $1,150,000.00* No Bid No Bid No Bid
12501-20000 $87.40 $92.00 $1,840,000.00* No Bid No Bid No Bid
Superpave, SP IV, Oil PG76-16 Conforming with NMSHTD Section 423. These specifications can be reviewed on the
NMDOT website under “Standard specifications for Highways and Bridge construction”.
20 0-5000 $89.30) $94.00 $470,000.00* No Bid No Bid No Bid
. Delivered to site Ton 5001-12500 $89.30 $94.00 $1,175,000.00* No Bid No Bid No Bid
12501-20000 $89.30] $94.00 $1,880,000.00* No Bid No Bid No Bid
21 5/8” Aggregate Conforming to Section 410 of specifications
21A Delivered to site Ton 200 $19.00) $20.00 $4,000.00 $16.15] $17.00 $3,400.00!
22 V2" Aggregate Conforming to Section 410 of specifications
22A Delivered to site Ton 1500 $19.00 $20.00 $30,000.00 $16.15 $17.00 $25,500.00

Page 2
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PEOPLE HEL PEOPLE

CITY OF LAS CRUCES PURCHASING DEPARTMENT
ABSTRACT OF BID: Road Construction Materials Price Agreement 10-11-503
OPENING DATE: March 31, 2011 @ 10:00 a.m.

3/8" Aggregate Conforming 3 Section a._o of spec

Delivered to site

DELIVERY:
PRICES EFFECTIVE THROUGH:
PAYMENT TERMS:
PREFERENCE NUMBER:

NoBids: Jobe Materials, L.P.

\J\\.ﬂ.
me.:» 03.»2 Bid _2_«

<a_.52_rc3 Karen Medina, wn.:cw Buyer

Page 3

$25,500.00

ABSTRACT



3 City of Las Cru

CITY OF LAS CRUCES PURCHASING DEPARTMENT
ABSTRACT OF BID: Road Construction Materials Price Agreement 10-11-503
OPENING DATE: March 31, 2011 @ 10:00 a.m.

der

ITEM i DE ow:..ns U RICE: x. :
1 Ready Mix Oonoqna uooo PSI Conforming S_E woacos uoo &. msnn_mom-_ozm Fomw than 3 Yd%)
LA Delivered to site ] Yd® I 1000 $87.00]  $87,000.00 No Bid No Bid
2 [Ready Mix Concrete 3000 PSI Conforming with Section 500 of specifications (3 Yd* & ter) L
A Delivered to site | 1000 $83.50] $83,500.00 No Bid No Bid
3 -|Polypropylene/fiber-glass fiber added to Yd3 concrete mix Conforming with Section 500 of specifications
A Delivered to site mixed in concrete [ Pound (added to Yd® concrete) | 250 $5.00]  $1,250.00 No Bid| No Bid
4. . |Flowable Fill Conforming with Section 515 of specifications
4A 2 Sack Mix - delivered to site | Ydd 1000 $75.00,  $75,000.00 No Bid No Bid
4B 3 Sack Mix - delivered to site | Yd* 1000 $80.00] $80,000.00 No Bid No Bid
"5 i|Crusher Fines Conforming with Section 235 of specifications
Lo City to pick up | Ton 1000 $5.00] _$5,000.00 $3.65 $3,650.00
2 I Delivered to site | Ton 1000 $8.00  $8,000.00 $8.65 $8,650.00
6. . |Base Course Conforming with Section 210 of specifications
6A City to pick up Ton 1000 $7.15] $7,150.00 $4.65 $4,650.00
6B . Delivered to site Ton 4000 $9.15|  $36,600.00 $8.95 $35,800.00
7 . |Rip Rap Rock Type H Conforming with Section 225 of specifications
7A City to pick up | Ton 500 $18.00) $9,000.00 No Bid No Bid
7B Delivered to site | Ton 500 $22.00] $11,000.00 No Bid No Bid
8 " “|Rip Rap Type L Conforming with Section 225 of specifications
8A City to pick up | Ton 1000 $18.00] $18,000.00: No Bid| No Bid
8B Delivered to site | Ton 1000 $22.00[  $22,000.00 No Bid] No Bid
9 Rip Rap Rock Type VL Conforming with Section 225 of specifications
9A City to pick up Ton 1000 $18.00] $18,000.00 No Bid] No Bid
9B Delivered to site Ton 1000 $22.00]  $22,000.00 No Bid No Bid|
10 Rip Rap Rock Type M Conforming with Section 225 of specifications
10A City to pick up Ton 1000 $18.00{ $18,000.00 No Bid| No Bid
10B Delivered to site Ton 1000 $22.00{ $22,000.00 No Bid] No Bid
11 Hot Mix Asphalt Type A Conforming with Section 325 of specifications
11A City to pick up Ton 500 $18.00]  $9,000.00 No Bid No Bid
1B Delivered to site Ton 250 $22.00]  $5,500.00 No Bid| No Bid
12 Hot Mix Asphalt Type B Conforming with Section 325 of specifications
12A City to pick up Ton 2500 No Bid| No Bid No Bid No Bid
12B Delivered to site Ton 0-3000 No Bid No Bid $84.00 $420,000.00*
5001-10000 No Bid| No Bid $80.00] $800,000.00*
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CITY OF LAS CRUCES PURCHASING DEPARTMENT
ABSTRACT OF BID: Road Construction Materials Price Agreement 10-11-503

OPENING DATE: March 31,2011 @ 10:00 a.m.

ITEM:. | i 5 DESCRIPTION:
13. Hot Mix Asphalt Type C Conforming with Section 325 of specifications
13A_ - City to pick up Ton 2500 No Bid| No Bid No Bid No Bid
e 0-5000 No Bid| No Bid $86.00] $430,000.00*
13B Delivered to site Ton
; 5001-10000 No Bid| No Bid $82.00 $820,000.00*
14 .|Cold Mix Asphalt Conforming with Section 320 of specifications
14A City to pick up Ton 1000 No Bid| No Bid No Bid| No Bid
"~ 15 " |3/4" Gravel Confonning with Section 230 of specifications
15A City to pick up Ton 200 $8.00]  $1,600.00 No Bid| No Bid
16: 1” Gravel Conforming with Section 230 of specifications (over 6 tons)
DA City pick up | Ton | 200 $8.25]  $1,650.00 No Bid No Bid
oy |Plaster Sand Conforming with Section 240 of specifications (over 6 tons)
17A City pick up | Ton ] 500 No Bid No Bid No Bid| No Bid
18 4™ 10 6” River Rock (Clean, Native Rock) Must meet the approval of engineer or his/her d prior to delivery
18A° Delivered to site | Ton | 500 $16.00]  $8,000.00 No Bid No Bid
— | Superpave, SP I, Oil PG76-16 Conforming with NMSHTD Section 423. These specifications can be reviewed on the
NMDOT website under “Standard specifications for Highways and Bridge construction”.
19 0-5000 No Bid| No Bid No Bid| No Bid
Delivered to site Ton 5001-12500 No Bid| No Bid $91.75 $1,146,875.00%
12501-20000 No Bid| No Bid| $90.00) $1,800,000.00*
Superpave, SP 1V, Oil PG76-16 Conforming with NMSHTD Section 423. These specifications can be reviewed on the
NMDOT website under “Standard specifications for Highways and Bridge construction”.
20 0-5000 No Bid No Bid| No Bid| No Bid|
Delivered to site Ton 5001-12500 No Bid| No Bid $93.75] $1,171,875.00*
12501-20000 No Bid No Bid $92.00) $1,840,000.00*
21 5/8” Aggregate Conforming to Section 410 of specifications
21A Delivered to site Ton 200 $16.000  $3,200.00 No Bid| No Bid
22 V2" Aggregate Conforming to Section 410 of specifications
22A Delivered to site Ton 1500 $18.00]  $27,000.00 $19.75 $29,625.00
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CITY OF LAS CRUCES PURCHASING DEPARTMENT
ABSTRACT OF BID: Road Construction Materials Price Agreement 10-11-503
OPENING DATE: March 31, 2011 @ 10:00 2.m

3/8 >m gregate Conforming to Section 410 of mnmo;. ications
U«:E-& 10 site

DELIVERY:
PRICES EFFECTIVE THROUGH:
PAYMENT TERMS:
|PREFERENCE NUMBER:

NoBids: Jobe Materials, L.P.

Y g i

<E.5\2_ v{ Karen Zn&._uwwnumo.. Buyer
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